
BID TABULATION
Pool Chemicals

Bid #PUR1016-088

November 18, 2016 at 3:00pm

Line Item Description

Estimated Qty 

per season Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended

Pulsar Briquettes, 50lb pail 300 $109.50 $32,850.00 $102.00 $30,600.00 no bid no bid $112.75 $33,825.00 no bid no bid

Pulsar Plus Shock, 75% Available Chlorine, 

25lb pail 30 $61.48 $1,844.40 $59.90 $1,797.00 no bid no bid $85.00 $2,550.00 no bid no bid

Pulsar Sunscreen 20 C.A., 40lb pail 35 $89.00 $3,115.00 $88.00 $3,080.00 no bid no bid no  bid no bid no bid no bid

Sodium Bicarbonate, 50lb bag 600 $19.90 $11,940.00 no bid no bid $22.55 $13,530.00 $15.50 $9,300.00 $32.00 $19,200.00

77-80% Calcium Chloride Flakes, 50lb bag 100 $21.00 $2,100.00 no bid no bid $24.00 $2,400.00 $18.00 $1,800.00 $26.00 $2,600.00

Estimated Delivery:

Notes: 

Signature Page

1 Do You Accept Credit Card for Payment?

2 Quick Pay Discount

3 Does Discount Apply to MasterCard?

VENDORS

Vendor Location

Local Business Certificate on File (Yes/No)

ACCO Unlimited

Johnston, IA

No

3-6 days14 days

Arch Chemicals, Inc

Alphretta, GA

No

Yes

None

N/A

Yes Yes Yes

N/A

No

Carrico Aquatic 

Resources, Inc

Jefferson, WI

No

30 days

Yes

Hawkins, Inc

Roseville, MN

No

3-4 days

N/A

No

N/A

Pool Tech

Cedar Rapids, IA

Yes

5-7 days

prices held for 180 days


